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LAPORTE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Tuesday, December 8, 2009

The LaPorte County Board of Commissioners met in a regular meeting on Tuesday, December 8, 2009,
at 6:00 p.m. in the LaPorte County Complex Meeting Room #3.

CALL MEETING TO ORDER

Mrs. Huston, President, called the meeting to order at 6:00 p.m.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Mrs. Reathel Noveroske led the Pledge of Allegiance.

Mrs. Huston, please remain standing for a moment of silent prayer for our troops & peace throughout
the world. .

ROLL CALL
All present

APPROVAL OF AGENDA

Mr. Layton made a motion to approve the daas pr d ded by Mr. Bohacek, motion
carried by voice vote 3-0.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Mr. Bohacek made a motion to approve the mi of Ni ber 17, 2009, ded by Mr. Layton,
motion carried by voice vote 3-0. :

WEEKLY REPORTS
The Commissioners review and sign the weekly reports during the meeting.
CLAIMS

Payroll Ending December 11, 2009, Mr. Layton made a motion to approve, seconded by Mr. Behacek,
motion carried by roll call vote 3-0.

Miscellaneous Claims—$1,019,546.00, Mr. Bohacek made a motion to approve as presented, seconded
by Mr. Layton, motion carried by roll call vote 3-0.

PUBLIC COMMENTS

Mr. Mark Yagelski, County Council President, on the agenda, I don’t see the contract on the Economic
Development group.

Mrs. Huston, that will be on the agenda for next week.

Mr. Yagelski, that is a day meeting so if you don’t mind 1 would like ta comment on that tonight.



In talking with Mrs. Sosinski and Mr. Garner who couldn’t make it tonight, we have not had a chance
to see the contract and see what was actually in it. 1 wanted to see if we could get a joint meeting
together because there are things in the contract that we are not in agreement with. Secondly, there
have been questions on both LaPorte and Michigan City having the use of Matt Reardon. You just
don’t turn on a switch one day and turn it off the next. We are still in support of using Mr. Reardon’s
services.

Mr. John Scarborough, 6985 S. Union Mills, IN, I would like to know why the railroad has no rules.
They did open the crossing on Long Lane today at 1:00 p.m. It has been closed three months for a
minor derailment. For the first six weeks they did nothing, it took two weeks work to get the job done.
Why can’t the Sheriff get some authority to take care of the railroads? It is 4.7 miles from the north
side of the crossing to the south side. This is not the first crossing that has been closed for months.
CSX is terrible. The Grand Trunk takes 7 to 10 days to get a crossing out and back in. The CSX has
no consideration for the people in Union Mills. There are three school buses that use that route. They
have to maintain the rails, but they could have a little consideration for the people in the territory.

Mrs. Huston, this was brought to our attention during several previous meetings. Our attorneys did
work on it and they reported to us this morning that it would be open today. I got a call from
Donnelly’s office, they also went to the Federal Railroad Administration. If it had not been opened
today, 1 was to call them back. We have no authority over this, it is a federal railroad.

Mr. John Regetz, E: ive Director, Michigan City E ic Devel and Tim Gropp,
Executive Director, of the Greater LaPorte Economic Development Cnrp We would be happy to
continue our review of the agreement of sur Economic Development services and spell out what our
staffing plans are to accomplish the goals laid out in our proposal.

Mr. Bohacek, during the workshop you made a comment that one of the reasons we can’t put this all
under one roof and have one Economic Development Agency in the county was that you have a
contract with a service for x amount of years. Is this the delay?

Mr. Regetz, this is a three year process outlining our options for consolidation and services.

Mr. Bohacek, why is three years the magic number, it seems like a long time to integrate two offices. It
would be nice to have one agency.

Mr. Regetz, we have several organizations to coordinate in that regard. It is just a process we have to
go through. We will have a consultant on board as we go through this as we just don’t flip the switch.

Mr. Bohacek, I think we need to find out how fast we can push this together so we can have one
agency. I would like to see that time line accelerated maybe within a year.

Mr. Tim Gropp, we are filling in the gaps and what is before you is a proposal of services to fill out the
Economic Development Services of LaPorte County and create some coordination in the process. We
put out what services are missing in LaPorte County and needs to be upgraded. We are here to help
LaPorte County. Our two entities have come together; our two boards have come together.

Mr. Earl Cunningham, County Council, second district. I would like to give you each a small packet.
First of all I would like to apologize to the C issi s for the undo criticism you are receiving from
the local media through no fault of your own since you had nothing contractual to do with the RPM
Fest. We are in a unique situation here, because I don’t know if anyone in the state of Indiana has the
experience that Mr. Layton has as serving as a Sheriff, Auditor, and Treasurer. If you go to page one,
highlighted is #9, “any other purpose that benefits the sheriff’s department that is mutually agreed
upon by the county fiscal body and the county sheriff*>. On page two is an email to Senator Arnold
from Bruce Hartman, CPA, State Examiner, it says, “As the two of you discussed, during an audit of
the county, we would not take exception to the payment of sheriff department employee overtime
worked if it is shown to benefit the sheriff’s department and is mutually agreed upon by the county
council and the county sheriff. The same is true for the payment to EMS employees for their work”.
At our last il ing, Sheriff Mollent took exception to the fact that he didn’t know who
Bruce Hartman was and maybe Tammy White was Bruce Hartman’s boss. I think Mr. Layton is well
aware that that is not the case. In this particular letter it says, “County general fund and commissary
funds are public funds; therefore, accountability and transparency are owed for all disbursements
made. These funds cannot be used for personal purposes including donations and other disbursements




that may be for good causes”. The State Examiner is telling you that you can do it. Mr. Layton, as a
former sheriff, if you saw in an email from the State Board of Accounts Examiner, would you have felt
that was authority to pay out of the commissary funds?

Mr. Layton, I would not take exception to it.

Mr. Cunningham, in your former capacity of Auditor or Treasurer, if you saw those same words,
would you.not take exception to it?

Mr. Layton, yes sir.

Mr. Bohacek, the C issi s do not have any authority in this whatsoever. As you try to compel
the sheriff to use commissary funds to pay these wages, how are we going to address overtime,
unemployment, pension, and liability? We just can’t hand them a payroll check. Do we give them a
1099 at the end of the year?

Mr. Cunningham, I don’t care how they get paid. We only have three choices; we can pay out of tax
funds, we can take no action and wait for a potential law suit, or give the sheriff permission to pay the
deputies and EMS out of the commissary funds. Our vote was to give him the authority to use the
commissary funds.

Mrs, Huston, if you remember, back at your July meeting, all of the council voted no to pay the officers
out of any of the funds. The point being, these employees work for the county already. We did not
enter into any contract. How is it the county’s responsibility or the sheriff’s to pay out of the
commissary funds? I could see if this benefited ALL deputies or EMS employees to possibly take it out
of the commissary funds.

There is a discussion about the use of commissary funds and how to pay the officers.

Matt Bernacchi, County Council at large. There is no contract signed. We want to solve this problem,
but not in court. We are trying to find a reasonable way to get out of this without using tax dollars.
This is the only way we see to do it.

Mr. Layton, I agree that everyone wants these officers and EMS persennel to be paid. I think there
has been an avenue opened by the council for that payment to be made, however, this body cannot
make that determination until the sheriff of this county agrees with the council.

Sheriff Mike Mollenhauer, I would like to make a short to Mr. Cunningham’s ions.
The email that was read from Tammy White says it is not a legal opinion, contact your county
attorney. Idid so. I also contacted our association attorney, Howard Williams. They both advised to
work this out, Don’t do it right now, you are leaving yourself and the council out to dry. I met with
Mr. Willoughby and he has worked very, very hard on this. There is an email to Mr. Baugher from
Mr. Willoughby en 12-7-09 at 9:07 a.m. which said, I spoke with attorney Paul Oates general council
for the state board of accounts this morning. Attorney Oates, after speaking with Tammy White and
researching this matter further, also appears to have reservations about paying from the commissary
fund for services provided at the RPM Fest. He also confirmed that Tammy was responding to two
different questions in her emails. The ultimate answer is that there is no clear solution to our situation.
There is additional concern on setting a precedent from paying employees from this fund. 1 would like
to see the officers paid, EMS, and Scipio Township Fire Department. We are not allowed legally to pay
the employees out of this fund right now. That word came from the County Deputy Attorney, Chris
Willoughby. It goes on to say, money disbursed from the fund under this subsection must be
supplemental or in addition to, rather than a replacement for, regular appropriations made to carry
out the purposes listed in subdivision 1 through 8. I have not violated the law in my 42 years in law
enforcement, I am not going to start now. If I can be advised that it is legal, 1 will be happy to pay.

Mr. Cunningham, Mr. Layton, one more time. If you received something from the state examiner that
you had permission to pay, why do you need to go get a lawyer’s opinion?

Mr. Layton, if I was in Sheriff Mollenhauer’s shoes, I would probably have paid the officers and EMS.
Iam not Sheriff Mollenhauer and that is his decision.



Charles Sidlecki, I am the Chicago attorney Mr. Cunningham reference to. I am a resident of LaPorte
County. The officers who signed up for that event responded to a posting on letterhead from Sheriff
Mollenhauer’s office requesting they work a detail. I have offered to represent these officers free of
charge. There would be no cost to the county if they just resolve it. It is public record that the sheriff
req d a bond. S ignored the request for a bond that resulted in this fiasco.

Mr. Mark Yagelski, it was proposed at the last county council meeting that we take direction from the
commissioners that the paperwork says it will be this way from now on.

Mrs. Huston, the contract that was drawn up for the officers, yes. We need to be very consistent.

Mr. Layton, your being president of the council and with our commission president here, it seems to
me there is a lot of contention on this agreement that we want to join with Michigan City and LaPorte.
‘We have this scheduled for our meeting next week. I would be willing to removing it from our next
weeks agenda if you and Mrs. Huston could set a time for all of us to set down on this issue.

Mr. Yagelski, that would be good. It was rushed in because of budgetary issues.

Mr. Richard Mrozinski, LaPorte County Council, the council has two things in mind. We all agree
that the deputies and the EMS people need to be paid. We are concerned with the threats to sue the
county because that is tax payer’s money. On your agenda tonight, item D. ALCO contract. Channel
97, we are footing the bill for government meetings, we want them aired live. We have never funded
channel 99, which is only available in Michigan City. Why should the tax payers have to pay for any of
it since it is not available in LaPorte, even channel 97 is not available to everyone in the county.

DEPARTMENT HEAD COMMENTS

Mr. Tony Hendricks, LaPorte County Surveyor, I have given you a map of Welnetz Road and want to
inform you on what is going on. At the town of Trail Creek’s board meeting there were a lot of
residents concerned about what is going on. Jeff Wright and I went out there last week. We have
permission from IDEM, the Army Corp and the DNR. The only thing that might delay this project is
the large trees and overhead power lines. I would like the commissioners to go to the town board
meeting to get support for this project and about if there is a cost, sharing the cost of this. The town of
Trail Creek’s board meeting is December 16, 2009 at 6:00 p.m.

Mr. Layton, for your information, I contacted Don Babcock from NIPSCO in reference to this
easement and the amount of large trees in there and expressed to him that there was no way that we
had the equipment or know how to take those trees down in their extension wires. He put me in touch
with Roger Van Schoyck who is in charge of the forestry division of NIPSCO. He will be available to
meet on this issue when he gets back in town on Thursday. We will have some knowledge on where
NIPSCO is going to stand on this. I don’t know if we have the rights to enter on their easement yet.

Mr. Hendricks, Dennis Metheny and Ed Muzyka are going door to door. I have offered my help if they
need it,

Mr. Hendricks, in regard to the emergency call list, I talked with Andy Reyna from IT and he said he
can post on the LaPorte County website.

Mrs. Huston, we call Darlene from IT and she can take care of that.

Mr. Jeff Wright, Highway Engineer, I have given you a hard copy sketch of Tiffany Woods. There is
equipment on site to install that over the next couple of weeks. This is just information if someone
should call you. We are going to raise the grade of the street 18 inches, but that won’t happen until
this spring. The excavator was out there yesterday and will work as time and weather allows.

Mr. Layton, have you been contacted by Ray Hamilton about this project? He had a phone call from
an attorney representing the abutting property owners to the north and to make sure that we stayed
off of their land. According to Mr. Hamilton, the attorney was saying that the easement is no longer
there.

Mr. Hendricks, here is a picture and it still shows the easement. We are working on our easement.



Mr. Wright, I left a small set of plans at your office for 421 and 400 S. The drawings are out for bid.
‘We will receive bids on December 29, 2009, It is 100% funded by the state. The project won’t be
awarded until February, 2010.

Mr. Layton, I want to thank Mr. Bohacek for sitting in on the wage and hour meeting. Secondly, I
want to thank you, Mr, Wright, for your tenacity of getting the 400 North project completed.

CORRESPONDENCE
None
REQUESTS

Approve 2010 LaPorte County Commissioner’s meeting dates

Mr. Layton made a motion to approve, seconded by Mr. Bohacek, motion carried by voice vote 3~
0.

OLD BUSINESS

Support County Council’s Position on 2010 Hiring Freeze (Tabled)

Mr. Bohacek made a motion to take off the table, seconded by Mr. Layton, motion carried by voice
vote 3-0.

Mrs. Huston, they have a resolution establishing a hiring freeze and it is Version 1.
There is a discussion and clarification on the language of the resolution.
Mr. Layton made a motion to concur with the county council on their resolution for a hiring freeze

with an exception on paragraph 2, it specifically refers to the common council and that should say
county il, ded by Mr. Bohacek, motion carried by roll call vote 3-0.

NEW BUSINESS

Receive and Open Bids for Farm Ground Lease

Mr, Layton made a motion to close the bids, seconded by Mr. Bohacek, motion carried by voice vote 3-

Mr. Braje, first bid from Rob Lawrenz, $24,084.70 for 106.1 tillable acres. Next bid from Tom Parker
is $13,886.00 based on 106 tillable acres. Last bid from Spring Mill Farms, David Thompson,
$17,082.10 for 106.1 acres.

Attorney Ralph Howes/Petition to Vacate a Portion of Kolar Drive

Mr, Jonathon Howes, I'm here on behalf of Ralph Howes. Mr. Larry Stevens respectfully petitions the
Commission to vacate a portion of Kolar Drive. We have a copy of the publication notice, and notices
were sent to two adjoining land owners. Mr. Terry Stevens is here in support of the petition and one
notice returned undeliverable. They are asking for the county to vacate the undeveloped portion of
Kolar Drive. There is not a road there; there has never been a road there. This would benefit th
Stevens’ so they can make improvements to that land.

Mr. Braje, Is there a legal description for the portion that you want vacated?
Mr. Howes, we can get that done and provide a legal.
Mr. Braje, you have to have some end point in the description. [ think it would be a good idea to table

this and get a legal description for that and then the issi s can ider that. For the record,
Mr. Howes has provided the publication, notices and delivery receipts.

Mr. Layton made a motion to table, seconded by Mr. Bohacek, motion carried by voice vote 3-0.



Al Ott, Stationarv Engineer/Bid Recommendations
Please see attached letters.

Mr. Layton, we were informed that in the bid specs there was no remedy for recycling the glass from
the windews. We would have to contact Mr. Bishop on that so that we comply with the grant.

Mr. Layton made a motion to approve the recommendations of Mr. Ott, seconded by Mr. Bohacek,
motion carried by voice vote 3-0.

ALCO Contract

Mr. Layton, I asked this to be put on the agenda to discuss publicly. The meeting we had with Mayor
Oberlie from Michigan City was a public workshop. The city of Michigan City is going out for public

bids or requests for proposals on ck 1 99, ch 1 98 is the school channel and channel 97, all three
of them. I know the county is obligated to a three year contract with ALCO currently that was signed
in July 2008,

Mr. Bohacek, Channel 98 is exempt from this.

Mr. Layton, I would like to include the county in that request for proposals that the City of Michigan
City is putting out. There is an escape clause in the contract that we have with ALCO if there is a
cheaper or better system that would come in. I would also ask that the council be included. Itisa
viable tool for a lot of people. It is a way for them to see what is going on.

COMMISSIONER’S COMMENTS

Mr. Layton, during this past week we have learned that former Commissioner, Mr. Bill Hager, had
heart surgery in Indianapolis and had a2 major stroke. We wanted everyone to be aware of his family’s
plight at this time of the year and that Mr. Hager and his family be held in our prayers.

Mrs. Huston, it is snowy out, please have a safe trip home,

ADJOURN

Mrs. Huston, President, adjourned the meeting at 7:31 p.m.

LAPORTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
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/ Barbara Huston, President

Michael Bohacek, /Vice President
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e
Kén Layto;(, Member

ATTEST: G“UQ Mzﬂ/

Craig Hinchman, LaPorte County
Auditor




LAPORTE COUNTY
BUILDING MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT

809 STATE ST. SUITE 102 A
LaPorte, Indiana 46350-3374
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Dear Commissioners,

Please put me on the agenda for your next meeting for i)rob;)sals for the
year 2010. The proposals and my recommendations are as follows:

Pest Control

Two proposals were received for Pest Control. A proposal for $475.00 per month 4

from Hatfield Pest Control and a proposal from Franklin Pest Control for $615.00 per month,
I recommend Hatfield Pest Control. They are our current pest control service and were

the best bid.

Trash Removal

Two proposals were received for Trash Removal. A proposal for $1537.00 per month
from Republice Services (Able Disposal) and a proposal from Waste Management v
for $1,453.00 per month. I recommend Waste Management which we have at

present.

Telephones

Three proposals were received for Telephones. A proposal for $20,651.00 per year from

tFrontrunner. A proposal for $21,075.12 per year from A T & T and a proposal for $50,265.00
per year from TRCA. I recommend Frontrunner. Their bid was the best and they provided
good service in 2009.



Elevator

Three proposals were received for Elevators. A proposal for $1,639.00 per month from
Kone Elevator. A proposal for $1,250.00 per month from Oracle Elevator and a proposal (/
for $2,455.00 per month from Thyssenkrupp Elevator. I recommend Oracle Elevator.

They were the best bid and come from South Bend.

Vending Machines

Two proposals were received for the Vending Machines. A proposa} was received
from Neal Vending and CL Vending. I recommend CL Vending\The prices were
close and we currently have CL Vending and would not have to move machines.

If you have any questions call me at extension 262.
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LAPORTE COUNTY

BUILDING MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT
808 STATE ST. SUITE 102 A
LaPorte, Indiana 46350-3374

December 1, 2009

LaPorte County Board of Commissioners
555 Michigan Ave.
LaPorte, Indiana 46350

Dear Commissioners,

Please put me on your agenda for your December 8™ meeting for replacement/
retrofitting of ballast, lamps, and lighting fixture within County Buildings.

After review of all bids submitted some varied on work to be performed and

the cost of each building. Some totals were not met and some failed to quote

price on some buildings. A total of seven bids were submitted. Three were
rejected for no bid bond. Bids range from $242,090.00 to $119,455.00.

After reviewing all bids and work to be performed my recommendation is
Marquiss Electric Inc. for $133,159.00. Marquiss Electric has done work for the v
County in the past and the work was performed very well.

If you have any questions please call my office.

Yours truly, ’
EXAMINED AND APPROVED BY THE
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OT THE
COUNTY OF LA PORTE, INDIAHA,
DME /220 i —
2 g Zos —
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LA PORTE COUKTY, INDIANA



Mitchel! J. Bishop
La Porte County Planner
809 State Street, Suite 502A
La Porte, IN 46350-3489

December 7, 2009

RE: Energy efficient lighting/windows questions

. Dear Commissioners,
There are a few questions Fwould have before a contract is signed the work commences;

1) In speaking with Al Ott, not one of the contractor’s within their sealed bid addressed recycling of the old
ballasts, lamps, and/or windows. This was specially addressed within the invitation to bid which was
advertised. I have attached a recycling company quote that releases death certifications for each ballast
and lamp recycled. Probably a good thing to show the Department of energy once audit time
commences. The consultant selected needs to make sure everything is recycled, reused, or stored for a
later date as stated in the invitation to bid.

2) Any contractor hired must report quarterly on their grant money received and utilized via the following
website; www.federal reporting.gov. The reporting must be done under the sub-recipient category for
the La Porte County grant award.

3) There are also a couple items I will need to go over with the selected contractor after a contract is signed.
These include weekly payroll certifications, random interviews of employees, and Federal Department of
Labor posters.

Respectfully Submitted,

Mitchell Bishop

Phone (219) 326-6808 extension 253 mbishop@LaPorteCounty.org Fax (219) 324-6349




Company: Laporte County

Fverldghts

Thank you for the opportunity.

Address:  N/A Anna Bakker

Contact: Mitch Bishop Cell: 773-410-9162

Phone: 219-326-6808 x 2253 9901 S. Torrence Ave - Chicago, IL 60617 Office: 773-734-9873 ext 114
Send to:  mbishop@laportecounty.org Phone: (773) 734-9873 - Fax: (773) 734-9874 Fax: 773-734-9874

Project: County retro-fit www.everlights.com - info@everlights.com abakker@everlights.com

Thank you for taking the time to look at the information that | am sending you. We have very competitive pricing and | know that you w

Date: 7/28/0§

be very happy with our services. All invoices come with a Certificate of Recycling for your records. Please make sure material is packaged,
sealed, and ready for pickup. If packaging supplies are needed please contact Everlights.

I . TOTAL:

4' Fluorescent lamps $0.23 EA $2,645.00

2' Fluorescent lamps 500 $0.12 EA $60.00 |
8' Fluorescent lamps B 50 $0.50 | EA mmw.oom o
PCBBaflast 9000 |  s0.52 LB $4,680.00 |
Fiber drums ﬁo‘nmn,wmmm\_‘m‘-svm ) 58 $10.00 EA $580.00 ]
m_\UOw for spent _\m‘.q,«‘..u‘m o ‘ 2 ) [ no charge EA X ‘ o
Steel drum dﬂoq‘m‘vm:ﬁ ballast 15 ) no charge _EA X ‘H‘
Transportation {LaPorte, IN) as needed | $75.00 ST X
ESTIMATED TOTAL $7,990.00

*Estimated weight for a 4' ballast is 3 lbs (3000*3=9000lbs)

If you have any questions or would like to schedule a pick up or delivery please call me at any time and | would be happy to assist you. My
hours are Monday — Friday 8am to 5pm. Thank you for your interest in Everlights.

EVERGREEN

supply company
distributor of electrical materials
Certified W.B.E.
9901 S. Torrence Avenue
Chicago, IL 60617

Notes:




LAPORTE COUNTY

BUILDING MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT
809 STATE ST. SUITE 102 A
LaPorte, Indiana 46350-3374

November 30, 2009

Board of Commissioners
555 Michigan Ave.
LaPorte, Indiana 46350

Dear Commissioners,

Please put me on your agenda for your December 8% meeting for the Window
Project. I am recommending Meyer Glass & Mirror Company, Inc. from Michigan
City. They were the lowest bidder and have equipment that met our guidelines.

If you have any questions please call my office at extension 2262,

Yours truly,

/ L/? ﬂ,—#/ EXAMINED AND APPROVED BY THE

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF TEE
COUNTY OF LA PORTE, INDIAUA,

23
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-
" A.
ATTES :_G_ga_m
s Auditor

LA PORTE COUNTY, INDIANA




Results of bids for the LaPorte County Lighting Project

Marquiss Electric Inc. $133,159.00

. Bancroft Inc. $242,090.00
Herrman & Goetz, Inc. $119,455.00
Accu-rite Construction Inc. $202,297.00
Emcor Hyre Electric Co. $232,295.00 No bid bond received
Koontz-Wagner Construction $297,983.00 No bid bond received
Frontier Contraction $313,416.00 No bid bond received

Results of bids for the LaPorte County Windows Project
Meyer Glass & Mirror Co. $79,500.00 ¥
Trout Glass & Mirror $107,000.00

Kaser-Spraker Construction, Inc. ~ $123,755.00



